
THE  MOTOR  VEHICLES  AND  ROAD  TRAFFIC  (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS,  2017

Arrangement of Regulations

Regulation

1. Citation

2. Interpretation

3. Regulations amended

4. Commencement



LEGAL NOTICE NO. 146

REPUBLIC  OF  TRINIDAD  AND  TOBAGO

THE MOTOR VEHICLES AND ROAD TRAFFIC ACT,  CHAP.  48:50

REGULATIONS

MADE BY THE MINISTER UNDER SECTION 100  OF THE MOTOR VEHICLES
AND ROAD TRAFFIC ACT AND SUBJECT TO NEGATIVE RESOLUTION OF
PARLIAMENT

THE  MOTOR  VEHICLES  AND  ROAD  TRAFFIC  (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS,  2017

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Motor Vehicles and Road
Traffic (Amendment) Regulations, 2017.

2. In these Regulations, “the Regulations” means the Motor Vehicles
and Road Traffic Regulations.

3. The Regulations are amended in–

(a) regulation 27N–

(i) in subregulation (1)(b), by deleting the words “$165.00”
and substituting the words “$300.00”; and

(ii) in subregulation (3)(b)(i), by deleting the words
“$100.00” and substituting the words “$200.00”; and

(b) the Sixth Schedule, in paragraph 7–

(i) by deleting paragraph (d)(ii) and substituting the
following subparagraph:

“(ii) the inspection fee payable for the time being shall
be made up as follows:

Inspection $ 200.00

Vat $ 025.00

Reimbursement for $ 075.00”; and
inspection documents

(ii) in paragraph (f), by deleting the words “one hundred
dollars ($100.00)” and substituting the words
“two hundred dollars ($200.00)”.

Legal Supplement Part B–Vol. 56, No. 131–1st December, 2017 393

Citation

Interpretation

Regulations
amended
Chap. 48:50



4. These Regulations come into effect on the 1st day of December,
2017.

Dated this 30th day of November, 2017.

R.  SINANAN
Minister of Works and Transport

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER,  CARONI
REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO–2017

394 Motor Vehicles and Road Traffic (Amendment) Regulations, 2017

Commence-
ment


